
Re: Borambola paidRe: Borambola paid
From:From: Daryl Maguire <dmaguire@ >
To:To: Phil Elliott <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au>
Date:Date: Mon, 11 Mar 2013 19:20:42 +1100

G'day , that's great , I had a great meeting with Borambola today , with Hudson Chen . It's big a very
big deal ,Also Maggie tied up our first Nominated visa applicant and  the applicant is very good . Peter
wood is taking that person on his pay roll.I have also got another 3 placements as well as your 2 , at $
twenty thousand per placement for G8 way .  
I need to have a talk to you but  perhaps on the weekend , 
Sent from my iPad

On 11/03/2013, at 3:28 PM, "Phil Elliott" < phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au> wrote: 

G’day
Borambola have paid and I will invoice RSL a token $550 today so there will be about $5000 in
the account.
Don’t think we draw any for a little while but just have it there to cover expenses if you need to
go to Solomons etc
Also I have a couple of thousand Yuan for your April trip if you want it. Think we may as well just
keep the money in my safe and then its available for you and I at anytime as required

At kapooka and hope late tonight and available most of Tuesday after 1230
Phil
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